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Case Report

A very rare mass in the uterus: 
Malignant lymphoma

Introduction

The female genital area is the fi rst site of malignant 
lymphoma; is a very rare localization.While most genital 
lymphomas occur in the vagina or cervix, uterine corpus is 
very rare [1]. Patients usually present with bleeding or pelvic, 
low back pain, but very rarely tumors are discovered through a 
routine examination. In the present case; When the radiological 
examination was performed for avascular femoral necrosis, it 
was thought that myoma was the incidental mass. However, 
the patient had no preoperative diagnosis and the pathology 
was high grade B-cell lymphoma located in the uterus. We 
were unable to make a preoperative diagnosis and we thought 
that it could be lyomyosarcoma. Here we report a case of 
primary lymphoma of the uterus, which is very rare among 
postmenopausal masses.

Case

The 60-year-old patient had menopause for 12 years and 
had two deliveries. When he presented to the orthopedics 
department for leg pain, radiological examinations were 
performed for avascular necrosis of the femur. She was 
admitted to our clinic with a preliminary diagnosis of a mass 
which was thought to be fi broids. The patient did not complain 
of any bleeding or pelvic pain. In pelvic examination, the 
uterus was palpated with immobile and adnexal fi xation for 16 
weeks. When MRI is performed in our clinic; 87 * 86 * 75 mm 
hyperintense multilobulated mass was seen in uterus fundus 
(Figure 1).

Leiomyosarcoma was considered as the preliminary 

diagnosis. The tumor was operated. It was infi ltrated into the 
cervix and colon wall. The fragile 9 cm mass arising from the 
uterus was extending into the cervix and adnexa. Hysterectomy, 
bilateral salpingoopherectomy, intestinal anterior resection, 
ileostomy, appendectomy and omentectomy were performed 
due to mass invasion. The pathology examination revealed 
high grade B cell lymphoma and double expressor immune 
phenotype (CMYC + BCL-6). The patient was discharged 
postoperatively and chemotherapy was started by hematology 
oncology department (Figure 2). 

Figure 1: MRI apperances.
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Figure 2: Intraoperative appearance of pelvic mass.

Discussion

Primary malignant lymphomas of the uterus are the rarest 
of rare non-epithelial tumors. The ratio between primary 
genital tumors is 0.008% [2]. It is usually well kept in the 
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vagina and cervix. Patients will often consult a doctor with 
abnormal vaginal bleeding. However, the patient may present 
with different symptoms such as abdominal pain and urinary 
obstruction due to compression symptoms.

Endometrial biopsies may be helpful in the diagnosis as 
patients with primary uterine lymphomas usually present with 
bleeding complaints [3]. However, our patient had no history of 
bleeding. Therefore, no biopsy was performed.

A prospective diagnosis of malignant lymphoma of the 
uterus is almost impossible. In Magnetic Resonance Imagine 
(MRI), widespread enlargement of the uterus without 
endometrial or cervical epithelium deterioration is thought to 
be a specifi c fi nding in the diagnosis of malignant lymphoma 
of the uterus [4]. When MRI images were examined, it was 
seen that the common features of uterine lymphomas in MRI 
were large tumors with homogenous signal intensity and 
multinodular growth [5]. MRI images of our case had similar 
features. 

Conclusion

Uterine lymphomas are very rare and occur with atypical 

symptoms. Diagnosis is sometimes quite diffi cult and often 
mimics the malignancies of the uterus.Accurate histological 
diagnosis is essential for adequate staging and a correct 
approach to treatment. As in our case, it would be appropriate 
not to ignore lymphomas in the differential diagnosis.
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